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USD 9.074,16 en € 12.034,89

---—--- Originele bericht -«-v-e-~
Onderwerp:Fw: commision
Datum:Fri, 22 Dec 2006 13:36:20 +0800

Van:gladys <gladys.cwjm@chenwey.com>
Aan:e. vos <vose@home.ni>
CC:cher.uei <cher.ueci@msa.hinet.net>

Hi Eltjo,

We send you money for below items this morning.

commision for Aug/ Sep/ Oct: Euro/6905.75%1.314=USD 9074.155
USD12033.89

material (VGH3): EUR1416.35%1.314=1861.08

TOTAL:USD22969.12.

Please check whether you receive it these two days.Any question please teli me.
Thanks.
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Ergo, commissie in dec 2006 + jan 2007: €3.396,00 en $9.617,30
In het overzicht van 2007 zijn de commissies voor jan 2007 terug te vinden: € 1.772,85en $ 4,278,38
Hiermee komen de commissies voor December 2006 op: € 1.623,15en $ 5.338,92
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-------- Originele bericht / \/\
Onderwerp:re: D Q (}/b v \)

Datum: Tde, 1 Jul 2008 1519:07 +0800
Van: Gla dys.cwjm@chenwey.com>

Aan: e. vos <vose@home.nb>
Hi Eltjo,
Please refer to the updated 2007 commission details.

Best Regards |
Gladys '}

CHEN-WEY PRECISION MOULDING CO.,.LTD
Sales Department

Tel:+0086 0769 8556 5088

Fax:+0086 0769 8516 7667

Mobile no:+0086 135 8080 0190

Cijfers ult bijlage bi] mail d.d. 1juli2008
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Ergo: de commissies en bonussen ziin in 2007 als volgt geweest
Commisies: € 47.929,32 en $ 101.323, 59; bonussen € 17.402,38 en $ 36.190,63
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COMMISSIE 2008

-------- Originele bericht -------

Onderwerp:Balangg-<"

Datum:  Fri, {7 Apr 2‘%1'9603:52:13 +0800

Van: Simo : on.cwjm@chenwey.com>

Aan: o. vos <vose@home.nl>, e.vos@chen-wey.eu

CC: Gladys CW <gladys.cwjm@chenwey.com>, Doris CW <doris.cwim@chenwey.com>, K <pin.cwjm@chenwey.com>

Hi Eltjo,

It is true there isé mistake pn wrong typing for Euro and USD as you mentioned. Kindly have the revised balance stated on the attached file for
your re-checking. sl halance amount is 22,467.35 Euro that you should remit back to CW.

Best regards,

Simon Huang

Chen-Wey Precision Industry Co., Ltd.
Tel; +86-769-8556-5088 Ext. 183

Fax: +86-769-8516-7667

Mobile; +86-1360-026-9357

E-mail: simon.cwim@chenwey.com
Website: www.chenwey.com
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Cijfers uit bijlage bij mall d.d. 17aprii2009
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-------- Originele bericht --------

Onderwerp:Bonus

Datum: Fri, 17 Apr 2009 14:17:58 +0800

Van: Simon CW <Simon.cwjm@chenwey.com>
Aan: e. vos <vose@home.ni>

CC: B <pin.cwjm@chenwey.com>

Hi Eltjo,

| well realize your anticipation to know the amount Mr. Shieh grants for the said bonus and this should be decided by him within this week. After
having a discussion this morning, he granted to give you 10,000 Euro for your efforts in 2008, even we have bad debt from Formtech and
uncentain situation from Geisler. You could deduct this amount from the balance to remit 12,647.35 Eurg to CW as soon as the details checked
are correct. Kindly let me know from your side when this issue could be done.

Frankly speaking, | have been working in many companies so far. Almost of them simply do what they commit or state on the contract. If having
more, should be also quite limited. >From my point of view, Mr. Shieh treats you as business partner as well as someone ingide CW organization.
He told me this is an encouragement to you to create more sales this year and in future. Moreover, he emphasized payment coliection is vital to all

sales incl. you from now on since we don’t control it well.

Best regards,

Simon Huang

Chen-Wey Precision Industry Co., Ltd.
Tel: +86-769-8556-5088 Ext. 183

Fax: +86-769-8516-7667

Mobile: +86-1360-026-9357

E-mail: simon.cwim@chenwey.com . *
Website: www.chenwey.com

Noot: Het door mij te betalen bedrag a € 20 647.35 is verlaagd door de bonus over 2008 ter hoogte van
€10.000,00 waardoor het door mij te betalen bedrag aan CW op € 12.647,35 komt, zie ook de mail van Simon
d.d. 17april. Deze € 12.647,35 komt steeds terug in de correspondentie en wordt door beide partijen onderkend.

Ergo: de commissies en bonussen zijn in 2008 als volgt geweest

Commisies: € 79.938,35en $ 82.903,03; bonussen € 10.000,00

Daarnaast moeten de eerder afgetrokken commissies tbv geissler nog meegenomen worden
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